
  Pancake 
 

 
Breakfas t

 or Biscuits & Gravy

 VFW Post 79 1
 209 Cedar, Yankton • 665-3562 • Open To Public

 Children 4-10 $3.00 • Under 3 free
 Everyone Welcome!

 $ 6.00 All You Can Eat

 Sun., May 5th• 8AM-12:30P M

 Pancake 
 

 
Breakfas t

 or Biscuits & Gravy

 Regular Menu 5:30-8:00O
 Outback 8:30pm-12:30am

 5-7pm – Domestic Beers 
 $1.50

 5-7pm – Hamburger/
 Pizza Burger & Fries  $5.00

 Thursday

 Karaoke with Papa Ray
  8:30pm-12:30am
 Chicken Fried Steak
 Serving 5:30-8:00

 Bing o  Wed. at 7:00pm
 Sunday at 6:30pm

 Happy Hou r  M-F 4:30-7:30

 Friday

 Saturday 
 Entertainment

 Chislic Served Last
  Wednesday of Month

 VFW  Post 791
 209 Cedar

 OPEN TO THE PUBLIC
 Wednesday & Sunday

 5-7pm Cooks Choice 

 Overnight Trip To 

 Royal River Casino
 at Flandreau, SD

 Next Trip
 May 6th & 7th
 For Reservations Call 

 Hennen Tours
 1-507-530-0578 

 or  
 507-530-0587

 EVERY TUESDAY 
 AFTER 4:00PM

 Large Single Topping Pizz a

 •DINE IN •PICK UP •DELIVERY
 YANKTON  MALL • 665-2525

 THE TIME YOU PICK UP IS THE PRICE YOU PAY!
 EXAMPLE: 4:00-4:15 = $4.00 • 4:30-4:45 = $4.50 

 5:15-5:30 = $5.25 • 7:45-8:00 = $7.7 5
 Offer good until 10:00pm. Up to 5 large pizzas.

 TOP-IT THURSDAYS 
 JUMBO 
 PIZZA!! 

 Up to 
 3 Toppings
 $ 1 3 99

 Specialty

 $ 1 5 99

 Feeds 5-6 People

 BEAT THE 
 CLOCK

 All proceeds go to Yankton’s SAR K-9 Response Team

 Looking for
 Obedience Training?

 Classes Start
 Monday, May 6th

 For information & registration 
 contact Bill Sohl, Volunteer Instructor, 

 661-7077• williamwsohl@hotmail.com

 The Town The Town The Town Out On   Out On  Out On 
 Exhibitors on the north end of the mall: wood, pictures, 

 baby items, iron and stone garden items, purses, jewelry, 
 books and more. Live sketches & caricatures.

 Mother’s Day Craft & Gift Show
 Friday, May 3 • 10am-9pm 

 Saturday, May 4 • 10am-5:30pm 
 Sunday, May 5 • Noon-5pm

 Contact Kathy at 402-669-6774
 www.keshows.com

 Per person from OMAHA, LINCOLN, 
 NORFOLK, FREMONT

 NOVA  SCOTIA

 For complete brochure, call:  1-800-806-7944
 MOOSTASH JOE TOURS      www.mjtours.com

 ONLY 
 $ 2399

 With 
 $ 100  Discount  NOW ONLY  $ 2299 Single $3098           Dbl Occ

 Nova Scotia   August 2-16, 2013 COUPON
 TOUR INCLUDES:  •19 Meals •14 Nights •Motor Coach •New Brunswick, Quebec & Ontario •All Admissions Paid For

 Dbl Occ

 AUGUST 2-16, 2013

 Per person from OMAHA, LINCOLN, 
 NORFOLK, FREMONT

 CHICAGO’S BEST

 For complete brochure, call:  1-800-806-7944
 MOOSTASH JOE TOURS      www.mjtours.com

 ONLY 
 $ 769

 With 
 $ 50  Discount  NOW ONLY  $ 719 Single $829           Dbl Occ

 Chicago’s Best   August 14-17, 2013 COUPON
 TOUR INCLUDES:  •7 Meals •3 Nights •Motor Coach •All Admissions Paid For

 Dbl Occ

 AUGUST 14-17, 2013

 TH E   ARGO
 HOTEL

 Open Wed.-Sun. at 5:30 
 1-800-607-274 6

 www.theargohotel.com
  email: argo@gpcom.net
 CROFTON, NE

 Tiki Chicken or 
 Jumbo Shrimp 
 Dinner  $ 9.95

 plus regular menu

 Show Mom 
 You Love 

 Her...
 Bring her to The Argo
  for a Special Dinner

 Open 4-8 Sunday May 12 
 Please call for reservations

 Authentic   Authentic  Authentic 
 

 
Mexican   Mexican  Mexican 

 
 

Food Food Food

 Come Enjoy

 SPECIALS 

 FAMILY MEXICAN RESTAURANT
 2502 Fox Run Parkway, Yankton 

  Just North of Wendy’s •  (605) 260-1701

 All Day Sunday, May 5th

 UNDER NEW OWNERSHIP

 Dine-In & Take Out 
 2007 Broadway • Yankton • (605)260-1688

 Dinner Buffet served all day on Saturday & Sunday
 Delivery Available (City of Yankton) • $15 minimum for free delivery

 All You Can Eat Lunch Buffet
 $ 6 50 $ 6 50

 11am - 4pm

 All You Can Eat Dinner Buffet
 $ 8 95 $ 8 95
 4pm - 9pm

 Opening May 8

 Joe’s 
 Substation

 Rural Lesterville • 605-364-7414

 Don’t Miss Our
 All-You-Can-Eat 

 Broasted Chicken 
 & Pollock Buffet

 With Salad Bar
 Every Wednesday 

 5 to 9pm

 Idle Hour Theatre

 Fri. 7:30PM • Sat. 7:30PM • Sun. 4PM
 Students  $ 2.00    Adults  $ 5.00

 MARCH 8, 9, 10

 Tripp, SD

 ESCAPE FROM 
 PLANET EARTH

 Idle Hour Theatre

 Fri. 7:30PM • Sat. 7:30PM • Sun. 4PM
 Students  $ 2.00    Adults  $ 5.00

 MAY 3, 4, 5

 Tripp, SD

 SCARY
 MOVIE  V

 We Will Be Closed 
 Saturday, May 4 
 For Graduation. 

 Congrats Cindy & Dani!
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OMAHA, Neb. (AP) — Peru State Col-
lege and state and local officials have
asked a federal judge to dismiss a law-
suit in which a mother blames them in
the disappearance of her daughter.

LaTanya Thomas filed the lawsuit ac-
cusing the college and officials of ne-
glecting to protect her daughter,
19-year-old student Tyler “Ty” Thomas,
from fellow student Joshua Keadle, who
is serving time in a Nebraska prison for
sexual assault in a separate case.

Tyler Thomas has not been seen
since Dec. 2, 2010. Investigators say

Keadle told them he and Thomas had
sex that night at a boat dock in Peru on
the Missouri River.  

Keadle told investigators they later
argued and Thomas threatened to tell
authorities that he had raped her. Kea-
dle said he returned to his dorm room
and took a shower to wash off any phys-
ical evidence of their encounter, accord-
ing to court documents filed by Nemaha
County Sheriff’s officials. 

Officials searched the river and the
area but didn’t find a body.

Keadle, 31, has not been charged in

Thomas’ disappearance, but he is serv-
ing a 15- to 20-year prison sentence for
sexually assaulting a 15-year-old girl in
2008 while he was a college student in
Dodge County.

Keadle also was accused of sexually
assaulting a Peru State College student
in 2010, but prosecutors dropped the
charges, saying it would have been diffi-
cult to secure a conviction. 

LaTanya Thomas’ lawsuit says her
daughter should have been protected
from Keadle. The lawsuit seeks more
than $1,600 to cover the repayment of

student loans that Thomas incurred, as
well as unspecified damages for the
family’s pain and suffering. 

The Lincoln Journal Star reported
Monday that the dismissal motion says
officials couldn’t foresee that placing
Keadle and Thomas in the same dormi-
tory put the young woman at risk.

“At most, what may or may not have
been brought about by Keadle and
Thomas being placed in the same dor-
mitory is an opportunity for defendant
Keadle to meet Tyler Thomas, but noth-
ing more,” the motion says.

Neb. College
Seeks Dismissal

Of Mother’s
Lawsuit


