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 Inside Sales Representative 
 position open with the world’s leading 
 Aluminum Extrusion’s Manufacturer.

 Company offers very competitive pay and benefits package.
 Qualified candidates will have a two-year business-related 

 degree or equivalent experience is required, as well as computer 
 proficiency and previous telemarketing/customer experience.  
 Qualified candidates will have a strong customer orientation, 
 excellent skills in written and verbal communications, decision-
 making, problem solving and organizational skills. On a limited 
 basis, must be willing to travel for customer visits as needed. 

 Job Functions:
 • To act as the key interface with customers; to coordinate 
 responses for information and service requests from the customer; 
 works with the Regional Manager to book profitable business.
 • To acquire and maintain a comprehensive working knowledge of 
 the company’s products, markets, policies, organizational and 
 administrative procedures in order to respond to customer needs.
 • Works closely with the Regional Manager and manufacturing 
 contacts to develop and pursue business and prioritize internal 
 resources for existing customers to support customer service and 
 profitability goals.
 • Follows up on quotations.
 • Processes complaints from initiation through disposition and 
 credit generation.
 • Is a team player and works well in a group setting to balance 
 work-in-process
 • Contributes to the establishment of standard work practices that 
 eliminate waste, enhance cross functionality in the cell, and 
 increase team productivity.

 *Position closes: August 17, 2012
 Sapa Extrusions Inc.
 2500 Alumax Rd., Yankton, SD  57078
 Attn:  Jane Larson, Mgr. HR
 Or e-mail:  Jane.Larson@sapagroup.com
 EOE/Affirmative Action Employer

 Resumes 
 can be 

 submitted 
 to:

 • Lin e Co o k s
 • Servers
 • Ho sts

 • Ba n q u et 
 Servers

 Help  
 W a n ted

 Plea se Apply W ithin

 1607 E. Hwy. 50
 Y a n k to n , SD 57078

 319 Walnut, Yankton, SD • www.yankton.net
  605-665-7811 •  1-800-743-2968
 Equal Opportunity Employer

 The Yankton Daily Press & Dakotan is 
 seeking an experienced graphic artist 
 professional. Ability to interview and write 
 for special publications a plus.

 Qualifications: Experience in graphic design 
 and knowledge of Adobe Acrobat, 
 Photoshop, Quark, Multi-Ad Creator Pro and 
 InDesign. Applicants should also be detail 
 oriented, ability to multi-task and able to 
 function well in fast-paced environment.

 Full-time Monday-Friday. Medical, dental, 
 and vision insurance available. Paid time 
 off/vacation time available after 90 days of 
 service. 

 Interested applicants, 
 send a cover letter and resume to:
 Kathy Larson
 Composing Manager
 Yankton Daily Press & Dakotan
 319 Walnut Street
 Yankton SD 57078
 kathy.larson@yankton.net
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 Call 
 Gary Mendlik
 Denison, IA

 888-643-5508
 (712) 269-2661  (cell)

 When you use our services,
  you get the BEST

   Roofing, Siding, Guttering

 Local References Available
 32-years in business in Western Iowa 

 and Eastern Nebraska

©2012, King Features Syndicate, Inc.

1101 Announcements -
Events

SAVE THE DATE!
2012 Yankton 
Annual Fall 

Citywide 
Rummage Sales

September 
6, 7, 8, & 9
Watch your 

Yankton Daily 
Press & Dakotan 

for details!

Vendor Fair to be held on the 
Gurney Redevelopment prop-
erty by the River in Historic 
Downtown Yankton during Riv-
erboat Days August 18-19. In-
side & outside booths avail-
able. Call (605)260-6870 for 
details.

1200 Cars
2002 Toyota Camry, 22,700 
miles. Owned by elderly lady, 
no major accidents, one long 
distance trip. Leather interior, 6 
cd changer,new tires, sun roof,
heated front seats. Excellent 
condition. Asking $14,500. 
Please call (605)760-0589.

Buying junk cars, pickups, 
vans, running or not. Call 
McLean Auto Salvage. 
(402)360-0756.

Looking for a dependable 
used car? 
Very clean 2006 Pontiac 
Grand Prix GT, maroon, 
black interior, heated 
leather seats. CD/AM/FM, 
very well cared for, regular 
maintenance, new front 
brakes. New tires in No-
vember 2011. Would make 
an excellent 2nd family  or 
school car. $8,500/OBO. 
Call (605)661-3020 after 
5pm ONLY.

1250 Motorcycles
2008 Harley Davidson Fat-
boy. 105th Anniversary. 
$14,000/OBO. (605)660-0481.

1260 Boat Motors
Minnkota bow mount trolling 
motor, 62lb. thrust, 24-volt, 
with auto pilot and co-pilot 
(605)661-2598.

1320 Education

Yankton School District
announces the following 
openings:

High School Language Arts 
with or without Extra Curricu-
lar Activities.

Must have valid SD Teacher 
Certificate.

Must have secondary Eng-
lish/Language Arts endorsed 
to teach Grammar 9, Intro to 
Dramatic Literature, Soph 
Comp and Speech 9. 

Extra-curricular activity avail-
able:  Fall and Spring Drama 
Assistant.

Positions open until filled.

Applications and job descrip-
tions found at 
www.ysd.k12.sd.us.  EOE

1320 Education
Sacred Heart School is seek-
ing Substitute Teachers for the 
2012-2013 school year. If inter-
ested, contact Sherry Rockne 
at (605)665-5841 or Kathy 
Campbell at (605)665-1808. 

1335 Other Employment
Are you passionate for  guest 
service and true hospitality? 
Due to our business growth we 
have immediate openings for: 
Housekeeping We are inter-
ested in honest, energetic and 
personable individuals to join 
our team. Must be able to work 
weekends. Apply in Person. 
Best Western Kelly Inn 1607 E 
Hwy. 50, Yankton

Clerical position at small 
Yankton business. Benefits, 
creative work place. Email re-
sume to marketing@iw.net

Yankton Public Schools is 
now accepting applications 
for three (3) part-time eve-
ning custodial positions and 
(1) full-time evening custo-
dial position.
Apply at the Administration 
Building, 2410 West City 
Limits Road, Yankton, SD  
57078. Equal Opportunity 
Employer.

Part-time Help Wanted: 
C-Store and restaurant

Must be 21. 

CJ's at the Lake 
Call Bear (605)660-3677

1335 Other Employment
Director of Planned Giving

The Director of Planned Giving 
is responsible for sustaining 
and fostering a $1.1 million es-
tablished endowment  fund.  
This position will be responsi-
ble for all fundraising, develop-
ment, estate planning, alumni 
relations, and programming to 
support the missions of Sacred 
Heart Parish, St. Benedict Par-
ish, and Sacred Heart School.
The Director of Planned Giving 
position prefers a bachelor's 
degree with three years of fund 
development experience.  We 
are seeking a self-motivated 
individual with strong written 
and communication skills, 
strong motivational and inter-
personal skills , and an under-
standing of working with a 
Catholic organization.
We offer a full-time position 
with a full benefit package.  
Salary is commensurate with 
credentials and level of experi-
ence.
Please send letter of applica-
tion and resume by September 
1, 2012 to:

Father Mark
Lichter 

Sacred Heart Parish        
509 Capitol Street

Yankton, SD
57078

Or e-mail: 
saheart@midconetwork.com

Inside Sales: Yankton Daily 
Press & Dakotan is seeking 
an Inside Sales Associate. 
Must be professional, have 
excellent customer service 
skills and basic computer 
knowledge. Applicants must 
be able to type 35 wpm with 
accuracy, be detail oriented, 
follow deadlines, and able to 
function in a fast-paced envi-
ronment. Full-time 
Monday-Friday. Medical, 
dental, and vision insurance 
available. Paid time off/vaca-
tion time available after 90 
days. Interested applicants, 
send a cover letter and re-
sume to: Tera Schmidt, Clas-
sified Manager, Yankton 
Daily Press & Dakotan, 319 
Walnut Street, Yankton, SD 
57078 or email:
tera.schmidt@yankton.net

Plumbing laborers and jour-
neymen.  Four-day week, over-
time possible. Wage DOE. Call 
Randy at (605)886-6955 for 
application.  Redlinger Bros. 
Plumbing & Heating Co.  Wa-
tertown/Yankton/Aberdeen/Sio
ux Falls.  Redlinger Bros. is an EOE.

Warehouse Delivery
Part-time. Good driving record 
required. Will include receiving, 
unpacking, setup and delivery. 
Must be able to lift heavy ob-
jects. Hatch Furniture 
(605)661-9934. 

Wanted: Full-time Feed 
yard/cow-calf help. Must have 
experience handling livestock. 
Must be reliable. Wages based 
on experience. (605)668-2769.

Wanted: Part-Time 
Waiter/Waitress, bartender, 
bus person. Apply in person at 
the Black Steer after 5pm.

1335 Other Employment
Production Manager

This manager is responsible 
for quality, on-time printing and 
assembly of web products for a 
group of small Southwestern 
newspapers that also have a 
commercial printing customer 
base. This person also is re-
sponsible for the group's setup, 
maintenance and oversight of 
OSHA compliance guides for 
workplace safety, and ensure 
we meet these standards.

Your people and administrative 
skills are as important as your 
technical skills. You will be a 
working pressman as needed 
and oversee our 4-person 
press and prepress staff.  
Strong computer and technical 
skills are required along with 
knowing how to work with 
spreadsheets to track reve-
nues, usage and waste.  Your 
responsibilities will include de-
veloping and overseeing reve-
nue, expense and capital 
budgets for your department.  
Two years of college preferred; 
however, reasonable experi-
ence in print operations, man-
agement duties and print bids 
can be substituted.  

You will enjoy a competitive 
salary and bonus incentive 
plan, a benefits package which 
includes health care and vi-
sion, and sick and vacation 
leave.  Please apply by send-
ing your resume to Joyce 
Cruce, Human Resources Di-
rector, P. O. Box 1689, Clovis, 
NM 88102-1689 or email to 
jcruce@cnjonline.com.

1340 Part-Time
Part-Time Front desk clerk. 
24-32 hours a week. Apply at 
the Holiday Inn Express on 
2607 Broadway in Yankton.

1360 Income
Opportunity

-NEWSPAPER DELIVERY-

City of Scotland
Available

Great Opportunity to 
EARN EXTRA INCOME

$350 Per Month

$100 Sign On Bonus
after 30 days

Enjoy short early 
morning hours! 

Monday-Saturday

Ability to work with little 
supervision and provide 

prompt, efficient service a 
must!

Circulation  
Department

(605)665-7811 ext. 142

1360 Income
Opportunity

-NEWSPAPER DELIVERY-

Two Yankton City Routes
Available

Great Opportunity to 
EARN EXTRA INCOME

$300-$500 Per Month

Enjoy short early 
morning hours! 

Monday-Saturday

$50 Sign On Bonus
after 30 days

Must be over 18 with a valid 
driver’s license, proof of 
insurance and reliable 

vehicle. Ability to work with 
little supervision and provide 

prompt, efficient service a 
must!

Circulation  
Department

(605)665-7811 ext. 142

1435 Carpentry
A Full-time Carpenter 
Available. No job too small! 
Free estimates. Lots of ex-
perience. Call Bob Edwards 
at (605)665-8651.

For All of Your Carpentry 
Needs: Custom Built Win-
dows, Siding, Garages, Ad-
ditions, Patios and More. 
Call Andersh Carpentry at 
(605)661-1190.

Geneʼs Carpenter Service.
Additions, 3-season rooms, 
b a s e m e n t / r e m o d e l i n g ,  
doors/windows, garages, 
kitchen-baths, siding, total car-
pentry work. (605)660-4663.

Schramm's Custom Wood-
works. Custom kitchen & bath 
cabinets and custom built furni-
ture. (605) 665-9788.

1445 Childcare
Providers

“Get your giggles out” at Wig-
gles and Giggles home child 
care. Open 5:00am to 6:15pm . 
Will provide transportation.   
(605)689-0312.

Kidz Logik has Full and 
Part-time openings ages 4 
weeks to 6 years. PreSchool 
Curriculum, Well balanced 
Meals & Snacks, fenced play 
yards. Child Care Assistance 
accepted from South Dakota 
and Nebraska.  Call 
(605)260-2641 for more infor-
mation. Ask for Pam or 
Amanda.

Kolor Me Kids has open-
ings for children 4-weeks to 
12-years. We offer 
pre-school in a daycare set-
ting and before and after 
school program for Jr.K-age 
12. Transportation to and 
from schools provided. 
(605)665-7755 or 
(605)661-1806 ask for 
Lynette or Shelly.

Provider has openings, ages 
1-6, 15yrs licensed, nutritious 
meals, pre-school activities,   
pet free. (605)665-4164.

1490 Lawn -
Landscaping

Bahmʼs Complete Concrete
Face lift for your concrete
stamping, stenciling
Spray texture
Acid stains and dyes
Stoops, patios, damp proofing
Marshall Bahm  
(605)665-1234.

Custom Curbing Co.
Continuous concrete land-
scape borders using  tech-
nology and beauty to en-
hance lawns, gardens, drive-
ways. (605)665-4582.

1490 Lawn -
Landscaping

Toben Tree Service: Trim-
ming, tree stump removal, 
landscaping, pasture clearing, 
Cedar tree removal. 
Firewood/camping packages 
available. Fully Insured. Com-
m e r c i a l / R e s i d e n t i a l  
(605)660-4640.

1530 Roofing - Siding
Corby Johnson Roofing & 
Construction. Free Esti-
mates, work guaranteed, in-
sured. Also, specializing in 
Seamless Gutters 
(605)661-8097

Johnson Seamless Gutter.
Free Estimates, work guar-
anteed, insured. 
(605)661-8097.

JW Roofing: Shingling com-
plete tear-off, redecking if nec-
essary and insured. Free esti-
mates. References. Work 
guaranteed. Call 
(605)665-1167, or 
(605)760-1782.

1530 Roofing - Siding
Roofing, Gutters, Siding

Insured, Guaranteed, Locally 
owned. Call for free estimates/ 
inspections. Premier Systems 
(605)665-4655.

1555 Dogs - Puppies

For Sale: Pure Bred Hava-
nese puppies. 4 males, 1 fe-
male. All shots up to date. Dew 
claws removed and wormed. 
(605)661-8179.

1570 Lost - Found Pets
Lost Cat: Brown stripe long 
hair. Lost on 435 1/2 mile 
south of Hwy. 52. Short 
cropped ears, no front claws 
and only 3 teeth. Call 
(605)760-0589.

Lost: Brown and white short 
haired, male cat. Blue eyes. 
Named “Mugsy”. No front 
claws, fixed, skinny, skinned 
up nose. Missing part of back 
foot. Near Riverside Acres. 
(402)649-8126.

This male dog was found ei-
ther near Lewis & Clark or near 
Bill Baggs Road. Black and 
White, not neutered. Very 
friendly and playful. Young 
adult. If you know anything 
about this dog, call HHS at 
(605)664-4244.

Read & Recycle!

Read & Recycle!

HOME DELIVERY 665-7811

Read & Recycle!

Call Classifieds

665-7811

 Ace Bike and Fitness is 
 seeking a part time  sales 
 and service associate  for 

 evenings/weekends.  
 Retail experience preferred.  
 Stop in for an application.  

 605-260-2453 

 Kopetsky’s

 Now hiring PT/FT 
 Inventory Specialist  with 

 great customer service skills.  
 Stop in for an application.  

 605-260-2813


