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Start getting great local deals today!

www.forkfl y.com

 Manufacturer of heavy equipment has the following full-
 time positions for Day & Evening shifts available:

 GRAPHIC DESIGNER
 Required skills in visual art and web design with 
 experience using web/multimedia design tools and web-
 based programming to support marketing goals. 
 Associates Degree in Graphic Design preferred, or at least 
 2 years of actual design experience.

 FIELD SERVICE REPRESENTATIVE
 Service assistance on installation, start-up, and 
 troubleshooting equipment and operator training. 
 Analyze and correct technical field application, 
 operational and mechanical problems in person, phone or 
 other correspondence with dealers and customers. Bi-
 lingual (English/Spanish) and communication skills 
 required.

 TECHNICAL DESIGN SPECIALIST
 Prepare replacement parts manuals using engineering 
 bills of materials and drawings. Good computer and 
 proofreading skills required.

 MAINTENANCE
 Facility upkeep, installation and repair of company 
 equipment.  Maintenance and electrical experience 
 preferred.

 ELECTRONICS MAINTENANCE
 Maintain, troubleshoot, service, and repair production 
 equipment involving CNC controls. Associates Degree in 
 electrical or electronics technology preferred.

 ELECTRICIAN
 Knowledge of national electrical code, control panel 
 assembly, and relay logic preferred. Troubleshooting 
 experience desirable. Indoor work, no travel.

 MECHANIC
 Install, diagnose and repair diesel and gas-powered 
 equipment. Mechanical experience required.

 EQUIPMENT OPERATOR
 Operate forklift, payloader and truck for unloading and 
 distributing steel and materials, and load finished 
 equipment onto trucks.

 WELDERS, ASSEMBLERS, 
 MACHINE OPERATORS

 Various production positions available.

 EEO M/F/H/V

 Apply at:
 Kolberg-Pioneer, Inc.
 700 W. 21st Street
 Yankton, SD 57078
 personnel@kolbergpioneer.com  •  www.kpijci.com

 Team members will be rewarded with an attractive wage, 
 full benefit package, paid vacation and holidays, $1.00 
 shift differential for 2nd shift.

 Human Resources Department
 225 Cedar, PO Box 156, Yankton, SD 57078

 EOE/AA   M/F/V/D                     Member FDIC

 Experience...the Difference!

 MORTGAGE LOAN PROCESSOR 
 FIRST DAKOTA NATIONAL BANK is seeking a 
 conscientious, detail-oriented individual for the position of 
 Mortgage Loan Processor, Yankton.  The function of this 
 position is to complete administrative duties for Mortgage 
 Loan Originators.  Duties include verification, compilation and 
 coordination of loan closing and servicing of approved 
 mortgage loan applications.  

 Qualified applicants must have:
 * Minimum one year of mortgage loan processing experience
 * Experience in submitting files to underwriting, 

 preparing closing documents and shipping closed loan files.
 * Strong time management and organizational skills
 * Excellent verbal and written communication skills
 * Experience with Excel and Word programs
 * Strong analytical skills

 First Dakota offers a team-oriented work environment with 
 competitive compensation and excellent benefits.  Some 
 benefits include medical, dental, life and long term disability, 
 vision, career apparel and 401(k). Successful applicant must 
 pass pre-employment screening including credit history and 
 criminal record check.

 Application deadline is  Friday, August 17, 2012 . Qualified 
 applicants may apply on line at www.firstdakota.com/
 Employment or request an application at any First Dakota 
 location.  

 Individuals may also submit a 
 resume and cover letter by mail to:

 Resident Assistant Position(s) 
 at Cedar Village

 Openings for part-time (3 shifts/wk) and/or full-time (5 
 shifts/wk) positions. Positions open are evening shifts 
 (3:15pm-11:45 pm) and overnight shifts (11:30pm-
 7:30am). Positions are benefited with health insurance, 
 vacation time, sick time, 401k, etc.

 Duties include cooking, laundry, kitchen cleaning, 
 personal care, medication administration, housekeeping, 
 recreation, socialization and transportation. Previous 
 psychiatric experience beneficial but not required. 
 Applications may be picked up at Cedar Village or 
 contact us at:

 Cedar Village Assisted Living
 3111 Shirley Bridge Avenue

  Yankton, SD 57078
 Attn: Betty or Julie

 605-665-3401

 Sunset M anor Avera Health
 is now  accepting 

 applications for the 
 follow ing positions to join 
 our excellent team  of
  caring professionals:

 C ook 
 Pa rt tim e d a y a n d  pa rt 

 tim e even in g
 po sitio n s a va ila ble.

 For application m aterials
 contact the Personnel O ffice
 at Sunset M anor, Irene, S.D.

 at (605) 263 – 3 31 8.

 C ertified  
 N u rsin g  
 Assista n t

 Fu ll tim e d a y a n d  pa rt 
 tim e d a y po sitio n s 

 a va ila ble.

 Dieta ry 
 Assista n t 
 Pa rt tim e even in g
 po sitio n  a va ila ble.

 Bloomfield, NE• Yankton, SD
 605-665-4181

 We’re an equal opportunity employer

 •Vacation •Holiday Pay •401K 
 •Health, life, dental and vision insurance 
 •Long term/short term disability insurance 
 •Monthly incentive opportunities 
 •Pay range $10-$12 per hour 
 •Variety of flexible shifts 

 Join Our Winning Team! 
 Customer Care Representatives  Needed For Inbound Calls

 We offer:

 “I have been commuting from Hartington, NE and working for First 
 National since 1999. The monthly and quarterly incentives have definitely 
 offset my costs for commuting! Everyone here is helpful and thoughtful 
 and I have made many great friends through the years.  The bank offers a 
 great benefit package including health, dental and vision insurance along 
 with an unbeatable 401K package.” 
 Barb Becker

 “After retiring from the Air Force, I was looking for a 
 new career.  Since I traveled a lot in my past 

 position, I enjoy having the opportunity to talk and help customers all over 
 the United States. In just two years, I have been able to increase my job 
 responsibilities which has provided me with even more variety in my work 
 day. If you enjoy helping and meeting others, this is a great place to work.”

 Apply online today at
 www.firstnational.com

 Denver Dodge

 LOOKING   FOR   DRIVERS
 INCENTIVES & BENEFITS

 • Medical Insurance
 • Dental Insurance
 • Life Insurance
 • Vision
 • 401K
 • Paid Vacation
 • Paid Holiday
 • Annual Bonus

 an equal opportunity employer
 www.AmericanFoodGroup.com

 JOB  OPENINGS:
 Driver Positions:  $ 11.60 to  $ 13.61

 with incentives

 General Requirements:  Shag driver position with Class B 
 Commercial Driver’s License required with air brake 
 endorsement.  Will drive dump truck for local hauling - No over 
 the road - and other duties as assigned.  Must be able to back 
 up a semi-tractor trailer.  Hours will be approximately 8-10 hours 
 per day depending upon production needs.

 Cimpl  Meats
 Human Resources

 1000 Cattle Drive
 Yankton, SD 57078

 Maintenance Department

 319 Walnut, Yankton, SD • www.yankton.net
  605-665-7811 •  1-800-743-2968
 Equal Opportunity Employer

 The Yankton Daily Press & Dakotan is 
 seeking an experienced graphic artist 
 professional. Ability to interview and write 
 for special publications a plus.

 Qualifications: Experience in graphic design 
 and knowledge of Adobe Acrobat, 
 Photoshop, Quark, Multi-Ad Creator Pro and 
 InDesign. Applicants should also be detail 
 oriented, ability to multi-task and able to 
 function well in fast-paced environment.

 Full-time Monday-Friday. Medical, dental, 
 and vision insurance available. Paid time 
 off/vacation time available after 90 days of 
 service. 

 Interested applicants, 
 send a cover letter and resume to:
 Kathy Larson
 Composing Manager
 Yankton Daily Press & Dakotan
 319 Walnut Street
 Yankton SD 57078
 kathy.larson@yankton.net
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1200 Cars
1998 Grand Cherokee
108,000 miles,  new tires, oil 
change every 3,000 miles, 
some hail damage, 
$2,600/cash. (605)760-9123.

Buying junk cars, pickups, 
vans, running or not. Call 
McLean Auto Salvage. 
(402)360-0756.

For Sale: 2005 Subaru For-
ester 2.5x. AWD, auto, A/C, 
cruise, AM/FM/CD. One 
owner. Very good condition. 
101,000 miles. Asking $8,400. 
Call (605)660-2957 weekdays 
after 5pm and weekends.

Looking for a dependable 
used car? 
Very clean 2006 Pontiac 
Grand Prix GT, maroon, 
black interior, heated 
leather seats. CD/AM/FM, 
very well cared for, regular 
maintenance, new front 
brakes. New tires in No-
vember 2011. Would make 
an excellent 2nd family  or 
school car. $8,500/OBO. 
Call (605)661-3020 after 
5pm ONLY.

1245 RVs - Campers
2003 Star Craft pop-up 
Camper, excellent condition, 
rarely used. Heater,  3-way re-
frigerator, $3,400/OBO. Call 
(605)665-6288.

2007 Keystone Springdale
21’, sleeps 4, excellent condi-
tion,  $7,500. (352)214-6548.

2010 Forest River 33’, sleeps 
9, 2-slides outs, 2-bedrooms, 
2-baths. Used 4-months, 
non-smokers, $18,600/OBO. 
(605)254-7898.

1250 Motorcycles
2008 Harley Davidson Fat-
boy. 105th Anniversary. 
$14,000/OBO. (605)660-0481.

1310 Construction
Help Wanted: Hiring for steel 
erection crews. Construction 
experience preferred, year 
round permanent work, no 
overnight travel, drivers license 
required. Apply at James Steel 
3608 E. SD Hwy. 50 
(605)689-7321.

1315 Drivers
Wanted OTR Reefer Drivers, 
better wages. Be home more 
than the big companies. Lump-
ers paid. Practical miles paid. 
Plus much more. Check us 
out. Sometimes there is more 
green on the otherside of the 
f e n c e .  
(605)366-0670/(605)484-4861.

1320 Education
Sacred Heart School is seek-
ing Substitute Teachers for the 
2012-2013 school year. If inter-
ested, contact Sherry Rockne 
at (605)665-5841 or Kathy 
Campbell at (605)665-1808. 

The Gayville-Volin School
district is seeking after school 
program aides for the 
2012-2013 school year. Hours 
would be 3:30pm-5:30pm Mon-
day-Friday, based on the 
school calendar. Interested in-
dividuals contact Alice Hight at 
(605)267-4476 ext. 102 for an 
application and more informa-
tion. 

1330 Professional
Employment

Tax Preparation Office 
Manager

A veteran tax company has an 
exciting opportunity for a tax 
professional aspiring to man-
age a new tax office in Yank-
ton!  Ideal candidates are moti-
vated, energetic individuals 
who embrace community and 
will work hard to provide excel-
lent service to the people of 
Yankton. Tax preparers with 
an entrepreneurial spirit are 
encouraged to apply.  Sound 
computer skills are required.  
Management, sales or market-
ing experience is a plus.  If you 
just said to yourself, “This is 
ME !”, we can’t wait to hear 
from you!  The tax preparation 
business is very rewarding and 
virtually recession proof.  We 
offer competitive pay and 
benefits along with compre-
hensive training and office sup-
port services.  Email your re-
sume and/or qualifications to 
jobs@1040.com.

1335 Other Employment
Wanted: Part-Time 
Waiter/Waitress, bartender, 
bus person. Apply in person at 
the Black Steer after 5pm.

1335 Other Employment
Director of Planned Giving

The Director of Planned Giving 
is responsible for sustaining 
and fostering a $1.1 million es-
tablished endowment  fund.  
This position will be responsi-
ble for all fundraising, develop-
ment, estate planning, alumni 
relations, and programming to 
support the missions of Sacred 
Heart Parish, St. Benedict Par-
ish, and Sacred Heart School.
The Director of Planned Giving 
position prefers a bachelor's 
degree with three years of fund 
development experience.  We 
are seeking a self-motivated 
individual with strong written 
and communication skills, 
strong motivational and inter-
personal skills , and an under-
standing of working with a 
Catholic organization.
We offer a full-time position 
with a full benefit package.  
Salary is commensurate with 
credentials and level of experi-
ence.
Please send letter of applica-
tion and resume by September 
1, 2012 to:

Father Mark
Lichter 

Sacred Heart Parish        
509 Capitol Street

Yankton, SD
57078

Or e-mail: 
saheart@midconetwork.com

Plumbing laborers and jour-
neymen.  Four-day week, over-
time possible. Wage DOE. Call 
Randy at (605)886-6955 for 
application.  Redlinger Bros. 
Plumbing & Heating Co.  Wa-
tertown/Yankton/Aberdeen/Sio
ux Falls.  Redlinger Bros. is an EOE.

1335 Other Employment
Hillcrest Golf & Country Club- 
Full & part-time positions open 
in turf maintenance, golf shop 
and clubhouse. Apply in per-
son or by calling 
(605)665-4522 or 
(605)665-7081. 

1335 Other Employment

Part-time Help Wanted: 
C-Store and restaurant

Must be 21. 

CJ's at the Lake 
Call Bear (605)660-3677

Inside Sales: Yankton Daily 
Press & Dakotan is seeking 
an Inside Sales Associate. 
Must be professional, have 
excellent customer service 
skills and basic computer 
knowledge. Applicants must 
be able to type 35 wpm with 
accuracy, be detail oriented, 
follow deadlines, and able to 
function in a fast-paced envi-
ronment. Full-time 
Monday-Friday. Medical, 
dental, and vision insurance 
available. Paid time off/vaca-
tion time available after 90 
days. Interested applicants, 
send a cover letter and re-
sume to: Tera Schmidt, Clas-
sified Manager, Yankton 
Daily Press & Dakotan, 319 
Walnut Street, Yankton, SD 
57078 or email:
tera.schmidt@yankton.net

1335 Other Employment
Service man- Journeymen
plumber, full time (40 hours a 
week). Wages based on expe-
rience of applicant. 8 or more 
years experience required.
Type of work applicant will per-
form: -Water heater repair and 
installation. -Delta, Moen and 
American Standard faucet re-
pairs. -Drain cleaning 2” to 6”  
sewer lines -Small plumbing 
repairs and rough out changes
If interested contact Tom at 
Fejfar Plumbing 
(605)665-9269.

Production Manager

This manager is responsible 
for quality, on-time printing and 
assembly of web products for a 
group of small Southwestern 
newspapers that also have a 
commercial printing customer 
base. This person also is re-
sponsible for the group's setup, 
maintenance and oversight of 
OSHA compliance guides for 
workplace safety, and ensure 
we meet these standards.

Your people and administrative 
skills are as important as your 
technical skills. You will be a 
working pressman as needed 
and oversee our 4-person 
press and prepress staff.  
Strong computer and technical 
skills are required along with 
knowing how to work with 
spreadsheets to track reve-
nues, usage and waste.  Your 

1335 Other Employment
responsibilities will include de-
veloping and overseeing reve-
nue, expense and capital 
budgets for your department.  
Two years of college preferred; 
however, reasonable experi-
ence in print operations, man-
agement duties and print bids 
can be substituted.  

You will enjoy a competitive 
salary and bonus incentive 
plan, a benefits package which 
includes health care and vi-
sion, and sick and vacation 
leave.  Please apply by send-
ing your resume to Joyce 
Cruce, Human Resources Di-
rector, P. O. Box 1689, Clovis, 
NM 88102-1689 or email to 
jcruce@cnjonline.com.

1360 Income
Opportunity

-NEWSPAPER DELIVERY-

City of Scotland Available

Great Opportunity to 
EARN EXTRA INCOME

$350 Per Month

$100 Sign On Bonus
after 30 days

Enjoy short early 
morning hours! 

Monday-Saturday

Ability to work with little 
supervision and provide 

prompt, efficient service a 
must!

Circulation  Department
(605)665-7811 ext. 142

-NEWSPAPER DELIVERY-

Two Yankton City Routes
Available

Great Opportunity to 
EARN EXTRA INCOME

$300-$500 Per Month
Enjoy short early 
morning hours! 

Monday-Saturday

$50 Sign On Bonus
after 30 days

Must be over 18 with a valid 
driver’s license, proof of 
insurance and reliable 

vehicle. Ability to work with 
little supervision and provide 

prompt, efficient service a 
must!

Circulation  Department
(605)665-7811 ext. 142

Call Classifieds 665-7811

Read & Recycle!


