
HERVOICE JANUARY/FEBRAURY 2012 ■ 11

 HHEEAATTIINNGG   &&   CCOOOOLLIINNGG  920 Broadway 
 Yankton, SD 

 665-9461

 only from...

 Efficient and Comfort 

 And Now Thru February 17th Save Up To $1550

FINANCIAL

When it comes to retirement income, Social Security typically
accounts for the lion’s share, so it makes sense to understand how
to maximize your benefits. As you may know, marital status is an
important decision factor when it comes to timing benefits. But,
did you know divorce also comes into play? Many women see
divorce as a chance to start over, a clean slate, if you will. But just
because your former husband is out of the picture, doesn’t mean
his Social Security benefits have to be, especially if he earns more
money than you. In fact, your ex can actually mean extra when it
comes to what you’re eligible to collect.

Here’s why. If you were married at least 10 years before your
divorce, you may be eligible to receive Social Security benefits
based on your ex-husband’s record, assuming he’s entitled to them.
If he hasn’t applied for retirement benefits yet, you can still collect
on his record if you’ve been divorced for at least two years. This
holds true even if he has remarried. And, claiming benefits on his
record has no effect on what he or his new spouse can claim. Of
course, you have to qualify to do so. 

To claim benefits on his record, you must be 62 or older and
still single. In addition, your own work-based benefits must be less
than the benefits you’d receive on your ex-spouse’s record. On the
other hand, if you were the higher earner during your working
years, be aware that your ex-husband can receive benefits based on
your record. The same qualifying criteria apply to him as well, and
your own benefits will not be affected. 

How divorce benefits work
Once you have reached full retirement age, you’ll have a choice

between your own benefits and your spouse’s. Now you’ve got

some options. You can choose to receive your ex-husband’s bene-
fits first, while delaying your own retirement benefits. Waiting
longer could result in a higher benefit down the road based on the
effect of delayed retirement credits. Keep in mind, though, that get-
ting married again generally means you can’t collect on your for-
mer spouse’s benefits record, unless the subsequent marriage also
ends, for whatever reason. 

Prior to full retirement age, if you’re eligible for your own
retirement benefits and ex-spouse benefits, you’ll receive a combi-
nation of benefits equal to whichever is higher. Basically your ben-
efits will be paid first and then your ex-husband’s benefits will sup-
plement the rest. Keep in mind, the amount you receive depends on
the age you begin drawing benefits. Generally, the longer you wait
to begin claiming Social Security, the higher your benefit. 

There’s no one-size-fits-all solution when it comes to Social
Security and when to start drawing benefits. However, it’s impor-
tant to talk to your advisor and determine how to maximize the
benefits coming to you, including whether it makes sense to apply
for benefits on your ex-spouse’s work record.
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