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1010 Burleigh • $87,700
This is it!! Turn key daycare 

business with real estate 

included for a great price! If 

you have been dreaming of 

owning your own daycare then 

this is the property for you! 

Open and bright with plenty of 

room to roam. Huge fenced 

play yard with all the play

equipment included! This prop -

erty features 2060 sq. ft. with 

newer exterior paint, newer 

Call Chris Moore 
 661-2600

roof, newer furnace,

and light fixtures 

recently updated.

Lewis & Clark Realty, Inc .
 www.yanktonareahomes.com

 email chrismoore@lewisandclarkinc.com

Another NEW LISTING
from Lewis & Clark Realty!

Professional Real Estate, Inc.
1701 Broadway, Yankton, SD 

665-8970 • 1-800-210-1277

www.yanktonrealestate.com

NEW LISTING

Bill Bobzin
Realtor

661-0148 Cell
665-8970 Office

500 Regal Drive
Spacious ranch-style home 
with three bedrooms on 
main & two down. Large lot, 
private and well landscaped. 
Custom built home with large 
kitchen/dining area. Ideal 
 northeast Yankton location.

 Kaye O’Neal
 Broker/Owner

5310 Ave. E. (Kohles Acres) • Crofton, NE

Licensed in Nebraska 
& South Dakota
Member of the 

Lewis & Clark MLS

54997 897th Rd, Lot 14
Crofton, NE 68730
 Phone 402-418-0402
koneal@LewisAndClarkShores.com • www.LewisAndClarkShores.com

A super lake home with lake 
view and open floor plan.
Suitable as a full-time home 
as well as a summer home.
Detached 2-car garage.  Go to
 www.LewisAndClarkShores.com
to take a Virtual Tour of this 
 home!  $239,000

 Directions from Yankton: Take Hwy 121 past L&C Visitors Center & Crofton Lakeview Golf Course. Turn right (west) onto 897th
Rd. and go 5.5 miles. Turn right (north) into Kohles Acres/Grandview entrance. Follow Shore to Shore Realty directional signs.

 NEW LISTING

1670 Income Property
For Sale

1650 Houses For Sale

2912 Lakeview Drive #6, 
Yankton

2-bedroom, 3-bath, townhome 
with garage located in great 
neighborhood. 1,100sq.ft. fin-
ished living area. Move in con-
dition! $82,900. Call 
(605)661-5561. For more pic-
tures and information, go to 
www.yankton.net/2912lakeview6

4-bedroom, 3-bath ranch,
3500sq.ft., 2-car garage, fin-
ished basement
www.yankton.net/710w8th 
(605)665-8209.

406 Murphy Lane

3-Bedroom, 1-bath Ranch with 
many updates, great location. 
$113,900. Brenda Warfel, 
America’s Best Realty 
(605)661-2724.

43486 Kaiser Rd.

Beautiful lake area home! 
3-bedroom, 2.5-bath. Terrific 
floor plan, master suite, 3-car 
garage. $257,500. Brenda 
Warfel, America’s Best Realty. 
(605)661-2724.

500 Regal Drive

New Listing. Larger custom 
built ranch. 3+ 2-bedrooms, 
3-baths, large private lot. Ideal 
location. Offered at $259,900. 
Bill Bobzin Realtor, Century21 
(605)661-0148.

508 East 29th

5-bedroom, 3-bath ranch. 3 1/2 
years old. Custom built by 
Kirby Hofer. $254,000. 
(605)664-1508.
yankton.net/508E29th

911 Douglas

3-bedroom home, hardwood 
floors, double garage, deck & 
patio, $104,900. Erica, Ander-
son Realty LLC(605)660-2992

1650 Houses For Sale

Updated 3-bedroom, 1-3/4 
bath, brick home. Only 
$128,500. Century21 Profes-
sional Real Estate. Call Emma 
at (605)661-2224.

1655 Mobile Homes For
Sale

Attention!! We’re serious. 
We mean business and we 
want your business. Make this 
your year. Our brand new 2010 
doublewides and singlewides 
are very nice. And yes, we can 
set these homes on base-
ments. They’re built for any cli-
mate. 2x6 walls. Shingled 
roofs. Our homes are priced at 
incredible, rock bottom dollar. 
Save, save, save! Nationwide 
Mobile Homes. 
(605)665-0822,/1(800)779-
0822.

Income Opportunity, 2-bed-
room, new flooring, carpet, 
and linoleum. Nice Entry. Older 
Trailer. Discounted Price. 
(605)661-0606.

Lakeside Mobile Home Park. 
Lots For Rent. Ask about our 
$1,000 Mobile Home Moving 
Allowance. (605)668-2165.

Mobile Homes For Sale as Af-
fordable as Rent! Lakeside 
MHP. (605)668-2165

1660 Acreage - Lots For
Sale

152 (- or +) Tillable acres in 
Yankton County. Leona 
Sparks, Anderson Realty. 
(605)660-6078.

Lot on Hillcrest Grand Ave. 
Easy access to Hillcrest Golf 
Course. Call (605)660-1266.

LOTS FOR SALE

* SUMMIT HEIGHTS: vari-
ous sizes for any home in-
cluding walkouts
* JIM RIVER HIDEAWAY:
New platting, 2 to 7 acre 
lots, all with views
* HILLCREST EAST: New 
platting, Golf course access 
with walkouts, park etc.
* LEWIS & CLARK LAKE 
view lots
For information call Jim 
Tramp (605)661-2192.

Numerous lots north of Hill-
crest Golf Course-Ridgeway 
North development. Call Kirby 
Hofer (605)665-0524 or 
(605)660-1422.

1685 Want To Buy Real
Estate

ACREAGES NEEDED. 
Large or small... with or 
without house. Trade for a 
home in town, sell your farm 
site and keep the tillable. 
Let’s talk. At your service. 
Char, Century 21. Cell 
(605)661-0864, anytime.

1700 Merchandise
18cu.ft refrigerator. Murray
riding lawn mower, 17HP, 42”. 
(605)661-7043, (605)661-1697 
after 5pm.

2000 EZ Go electric golf cart, 
$1300. (605)661-4514.

1700 Merchandise
2 solid piece treated wood 
beams. 26’x18”x6” each, 
$1200 for both. (605)660-9003.

8x8 storage shed $600 with 
shelves or $500 without 
shelves. (605)689-3817.

New dark wood table and 
chairs paid $500 but will sell 
for $400. Call (605)661-8231.

Whirlpool Classic-style su-
per capacity washer/dryer. 
New in ‘07, $700/OBO. $300 
below new. Rarely used. 
(605)464-0647.

1705 Items $100 or Less
25 pounds of rhubarb, $1.00 
per pound. Call (605)664-1591 
leave message.

3’x4’ kitchen table with 4 
chairs, coffee color, $75. 
(605)260-9125.

4x4 table and four chairs, 
good condition, black. 
$45/OBO. (605)668-0435 

Frigidaire electric dryer,
good condition, $90. 
(605)260-1400.

Harley Davidson, Miscellane-
ous Chrome Parts, $50. 
(605)661-8964.

Like new 6’ cat tree/lounger 
$50. Like new automatic cat lit-
ter box $30. (605)665-1139.

Morfam Jeanie Rub hand 
held single sped therapeutic 
massager, washable cover. 
Safely relax muscles, reduce 
stress, stimulate circulation. 
Professional quality.  $75. 
(605)665-4169.

1800 Sports Equipment
93 Yamaha Golf Cart, gas 
with top & windshield. Serviced 
annually in excellent condition. 
$1,500/OBO. (605)665-2323.

1815 Miscellaneous
2 solid piece treated wood 
beams. 26’x18”x6” each, 
$1200 for both. (605)660-9003.

1830 Rummage Sales
1102 Summit St.

Saturday, 5/8, 7am-2pm

Children’s clothes size 
24months-4T through women’s 
plus size. Much miscellaneous.

116 Frontier Lane

(5-1/2 miles West of Hwy. 50)

Friday, 5/7, 3pm-7pm

Saturday, 5/8, 8am-5pm

Sunday, 5/9, 9am-3pm

Hunting & Fishing equipment, 
traps, decoys, aluminum bats, 
marine grill, trunk, Snapper 
mower, old outboard motors, 
depth finder, Dell computer, 
vacuum cleaner, table lamps. 
Quality boys, junior, women 
clothing and much more.

1308 Oakwood Drive

Saturday, 5/8, 7am-1:30pm

Moving Sale! Everything Must 
Go! Prom dresses size 16-20, 
women’s scrubs and clothes 
size L-XL, TY Beanies, uni-
corns, vacuums, picture 
frames, CD’s, books, lots of 
miscellaneous. Don’t Miss This 
One!

1403 Maple

Friday, 5/7, 6pm-8pm

Saturday, 5/8, 8am-Noon

Clean nice household items. 
Many new never used, jewelry, 
candles, China, dishes, sea-
sonal, curtains, formal, 
women’s clothes, miscellane-
ous. Antiques, area rug.

1802 Peninah St.

Saturday, 5/8, 7:30am-2pm

Huge Multi-Family Rummage: 
Low Prices! Single & Double 
Stroller, Excersaucer, Walker, 
Vibrating chair, Mobiles, 
Boppy, Toys, Easel, Play 
kitchen, Printer, Area rug, Kids 
& Full Bedding sets, House-
hold, Baby, Kitchen & Christ-
mas items, Namebrand 
clothes: Teen and Women's 
(M-XL), Boys (0-4T), Girls 
(0-2T).

2509 Dunham Drive

Saturday, 5/8, 8am-Noon

Moving Sale: Solid drop leaf 
table with 4 hidden folding 
chairs, Bird sighting scope, 
and much more.

2700 Pine St.

Friday, 5/7, 8am-5pm

Saturday, 5/8, 8am-5pm

Getting ready to move sale: 
Huge quantity of quality home 
decor and good usable stuff for 
every room in the house. Ga-
rage and yard. Rain or shine.

2811 West City Limits Rd.

Friday, 5/7,1pm-6pm

Saturday, 5/8, 8am-4pm

Collector items, new porcelain 
dolls, household, dishes, furni-
ture, misellaneous, clothing 
kid's girls 2T, boy's 10-12. Dog 
house.

308 E. 25th St.

Friday, 5/7, Noon-7pm

Saturday, 5/8, 8am-1pm

Clothes: Women’s 6-10, Men’s 
X-XL, dining room chairs, 
rocker, drapes, printer, X-box 
& games, fountain, household 
furnishings, much miscellane-
ous.

907 Hillcrest

Friday, 5/7, Noon-7pm

Saturday, 5/8, 8am-11am

Early 1970’s Jukebox, com-
mercial Foosball table, CD’s, 
outboard motor, bikes, 1951 
Chevy, guitar, furniture, small 
refrigerator, microwave, toys, 
home decor, VHS, Disney 
movies.

1830 Rummage Sales
31081 431st Ave.

(9 miles west of Wal-Mart 2 
miles South on 431)

Friday, 5/7, 3pm-6:30pm

Saturday, 5/8, 
7:30am-6:30pm

Multi-Family Yard Sale: Quilt-
ing fabric, yarn, antique floor 
lamp, stereo with turn-table, 
TV, twin camouflage bedding 
set, hand ice auger, buzz saw 
with stand, lots of miscellane-
ous.

Curlie & Tootys St.

(Riverside Acres)

Friday, 5/7, 3pm-8pm

Saturday, 5/8, 8am-1pm ??

103 Curlie

5-family. Clothing (kids 
b-10/adult), carseat, 12” boys 
bike, toddler 4-wheeler, 
stroller, toys/games, movies, 
books, telescope, home decor,
curtains, bedding, jewelry, vac-
uum, breadmaker, 19” TV, hu-
midifier, Beanie Babies, buffalo 
head, luggage, fish tank, misc.

105 Curlie

Truxedo cover for Dodge truck, 
futon frame, kids clothes, Avon 
products, screenhouse, cot & 
misc.

106 Curlie

Baby crib, Graco baby swing, 
dishes, 2--17” TV’s, Home In-
terior Items, miscellaneous.

108 Curlie

Hunting gear/camo clothing, 
bow accessories, Mathews 
Genesis Left-Handed youth 
bow, 26” Power Climber bike, 
girls clothes 3T-5T.

109 Curlie

Golf & fishing items, antiques, 
garden/flower seed packets, 
Large  live jungle cactus, west-
ern books, music books, old 
records, RCA Victor radio/re-
cord player

119 Curlie

Canning jars.
110 Tootys

Baby items-walker, stroller,
diaper genie, car seat, infant 
car seat, Clothes (boy’s b-12 
mo, girl’s  b-6x, women’s S/M 
& men’s L/XL), lots of toys, 
shelves, single & queen head-
boards, lots of miscellaneous.

119 Tootys

Play Station 2 games, boys & 
girls clothing 8-10/12, toys, 
movies & Celebrate Home 
items.

Augusta Circle &

Neighborhood Sales

South of Wal-Mart

May 7th/8th

619 Augusta Circle

Friday, 5pm-7pm

Saturday, 7am-11am

Boy’s 0-5, Girl’s 0-4, carseats, 
toys, AB lounger, bag sale 
10-11 Saturday.

633 Augusta Circle

Friday, 3pm-7pm

Saturday, 8am-1pm

Pickup tool box, Futon bunk 
bed, furniture, adult clothes, 
household items, tools, band 
saw.

635 Augusta Circle

Friday, 3pm-7pm

Saturday, 8am-1pm

Golf Clubs, Maternity, Kids 
clothes, toys, crib, changing 
table, bike, light fixtures, 
kitchen hardware, tools, bed-
ding, Play Station, Antique In-
struments.

Yankton Vendor Market

4-H Building 

709 Whiting Drive

Sat. 5/8, 8am-2pm

Unique Mothers Day, Wedding 
& Graduation Gifts - Scentsy 
Wickless Candles, Uppercase 
Living, Southern Living At 
Home, Natural Organic Spices 
& Extracts, body lotions.  Fro-
zen Food Vendor, Kuchen, 
Kolaches, Baked Goods, Girl 
Scout Cookies.   Hand Crafted 
Home Décor, Metal Yard Art, 
Jewelry, Fishing Jigs, Elk 
Clocks.  Hunting & Outdoor 
Supplies, Name Brand Knives, 
Body Jewelry, Military Gear, 
Tee Shirts and Cammo Wear. 
Variety Store Inventory at bar-
gain prices beads, buttons, 
cross stitch Scrapbook Sup-
plies!  Concessions. Too much 
to list – come and browse 
something for everyone!  New 
vendors added daily!   

607 East 18th St.

Friday, 5/7, Noon-7pm

Saturday, 5/8, 7am-7pm

Sofa, double rocking reclin-
ers, lamps, bookshelf, wall 
shelves, frames, books, gar-
den tools, lawn chairs, TV, 
VCR, stereo, TV stand, an-
tique trunk, old suitcases, 
much miscellaneous items. 
Men’s clothing 2X-3X. All 
priced to sell.

SAVE THE DATE!

2010 Yankton 

Annual Citywide 

Rummage Sales

May 13, 14, 

15, & 16

Watch your 

Yankton Daily 

Press & Dakotan 

for details!

710 E. 21st St.

Saturday, 5/8, 8am-2pm

Jewelry, knick-knacks, CD’s, 
movies, books, glassware, 
toys. Lots of miscellaneous, 
something for everyone!

1830 Rummage Sales
5th Annual 

Fox Run Rummage

Friday, 5/7, 5pm-8pm

Saturday, 5/8, 8am-Noon

1226 Pasque Circle

Toddler toys, boys clothing 
size 2-4, VHS tapes, DVDs, 
Ladies clothing, XL-1X, shoes, 
purses, kitchen items, 2-mauve 
rocking chairs, video games, 
books.

1214 Pasque Circle

Friday 3pm-8pm

Saturday 8am-Noon

Queen headboard, chest of 
drawers, area rugs, entertain-
ment centers, boys 
newborn-5T, maternity, toys, 
car seats, TV, VCR, Little 
Tykes workshop, outdoor baby 
swing and toy storage, Step 2 
picnic table, decorative wall 
mirror, home decor, baby bed-
ding, men's and women's 
clothing, complete planes, 
trains and automobiles twin 
bedding with rug and pictures.

2507 Mulligan Dr.

Pampered Chef, 
household/decor items, micro-
wave, teen clothes, baskets 
and craft items, adult clothing, 
miscellanous.

2604 Mulligan Dr.

0-3T boys, 4T-14/16 girls and 
adult clothing, Little Tykes, lots 
of toys, DVD's, crafts, scrap-
booking, entertainment center, 
tools, holiday decorations, park 
bench, crib and mattress, 
Rainforest theme: swing, travel 
swing bouncer, jumper.

2703 Mulligan Dr.

Oak TV armoire, coffee 
table/end table glass panel in-
serts, small teen girl clothing, 
pictures, home decor.

2709 Mulligan Dr.

Picnic table, chairs, bench, 
umbrella, plus size women's 
clothes, boys and girls name 
brand clothes, household 
items, Avon. 

2807 Mulligan Dr.

Name brand boys 0-18 
months, toys lamps, miscella-
nous.

2901 Mulligan Dr.

Eton 49cc Scooter, Kenmore 
washing machine, 27” Sony 
TV, TV stand, Home Brewing 
Kits, vacuum, girls bicycles, fit-
ness equipment, junior set left 
handed golf clubs, children's 
clothes  4-10, lots of miscella-
neous.

3102 Mulligan Dr.

Boys clothes newborn-4T, girls 
clothes newborn-size 7, baby 
toys and gear, girls toys, king 
size headboard, power painter.

3107 Mulligan Dr.

Name brand girls 
newborn-12mo, boys 6-8, 
men's XL, women's 12/14, and 
maternity size L and XL, baby 
gear, toys, books, lots of home 
decor, picture frames, shelves, 
women's shoes size-11, nice 
futon, Cross Trainer Recum-
bent bike, large area rugs.

3208 Mulligan Dr.

Friday Noon - 6:30 p.m. 
ONLY

Baby swing, car seat, bouncy 
seat, jumper, high chair, baby 
tub slings, girls clothing (new-
born-4T), boys clothing (new-
born-24-months), maternity 
clothing, various home decor.

3211 Mulligan Dr.

Weight equipment, furniture, 
appliances, rims, tires, clothes, 
pictures, shoes, tools, miscel-
laneous.

3215 Mulligan Dr.

Old MEC reloading press, 
baby boy clothes, some baby 
items, table and chairs, lots of 
miscellaneous.

3308 Mulligan Dr.

Couch, console TV, 13” TV, 
6-drawer dresser with mirror, 
solid oak daybed, solid wood 
twin bed, twin trundle, book-
shelf, brass stand, books, 2 
I-Pod Nanos, lots of miscella-
neous.

2703 Abbott Circle

Gap, Tommy, Old Navy, Nike 
clothes, Girls 24months-3T, 
Boys 4T - 8 & juniors, Ladies 
8-12, New Riverboat Days 
clothing, Baby items and toys, 
books, Disney VHS, Double 
running stroller, 2-girls bikes, 
Cars TV, VCR, Casio Key-
board, Tracker trolling motor 
30 lb. trust, with foot pedal , Vi-
kings memorabilia, Household 
items and much more. 

2600 Abbott Dr.

Name brand clothing 
(teen-adult), maternity clothing, 
baby swing, exersaucer, day-
bed, computer desk and chair,
decorative vases, lamps, wine 
fridge, purses.

2604 Abbott Dr

Moving Sale: Like new living 
room set, loveseat, children's 
clothes, toys, dorm carpet, lots 
of miscellaneous.

2610 Abbott Dr.

6x12 outdoor dog kennel, 
misc, small/medium women's 
clothes, little girls clothes.

1830 Rummage Sales
2700 Abbott Dr.

18-months-4T boys clothes, 
kids toys, kids Halloween cos-
tumes, households/decora-
tions, XL women's maternity, 
toys storage bins, women's 
clothes size small,medium,XL, 
elliptical and armoire.

2701 Abbott Dr.

Gun cabinet, hunting and fish-
ing items, stampin'-up items, 
household items, cash only.

2708 Abbott Dr.

Friday 5:30pm-8:30pm

Saturday 8am -Noon

HUGE 3 family rummage. Lots 
of kids clothes (Gymboree, 
Children's Place), girls 3T-5T, 
boys 6-7, kids bikes, books, 
toys, women's medical scrubs 
size large, women's clothing, 
household items (dishes, pans, 
etc.), dressers, table & 
4-chairs, floor lamp, stamping 
and scrapbook items, plants.

1840 Lost and Found
Lost keys at Monta’s Framing 
in the mall on Saturday 5/01. If 
anyone came home with an 
extra set of keys please call 
(605)664-2328.

1875 Livestock - Poultry
“Turn out Time” Registered 
Black Angus Bull sale on Fri-
day, 5/21 at the Verdigre Auc-
tion Barn. 24 Yearlings, Two 2 
year olds, One 3 year old. AM 
and NH free. Semen tested. 
No bulls sold prior to sale. 
Catalogs available. Doerr 
Farms LLC, (402)373-4447.

have to change its market-
ing materials and other
things with an address,
Specht stated.

However, about half of
the 14 residences and nine
businesses along the road
approved of the new name.
The rest — except for the
aforementioned business —
appeared to be neutral on
the issue.

City Manager Doug
Russell has endorsed the
name change, which would
incur minimal costs for the
city in the form of new
street signs.

XYZ states in the letter
that this is an opportune
time to rename the road.

“Now is the time to act
before more development
takes place,” it reads. “The
nearly completed construc-
tion of the Dataware build-

ing, which will also house
SDN Communications, and
the (construction of the)
Yankton Public Schools
administration building
make this request timely.
Occupancy for the Dataware
building is set for this
month, and the school
buildings for mid-summer.”

In other business
Monday, the commission will
reorganize for the year and
choose a new mayor. Three
commissioners will take an
oath of office — Charlie
Gross, Paul Lowrie and Brad
Woerner. Specht decided not
to run for re-election earlier
this year, and Woerner will
be filling his commission
seat.

Also, the commission will
consider an airport fuel tank
lease revision and a reconfig-
uration of Second Street east
of Broadway to three lanes
with parallel parking.

The meeting gets under
way at 7 p.m. in the City of
Yankton Meeting Room,
located at the Technical
Education Center, 1200 W.
21st St.

CITY
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a dollar to wear blue jeans
or give some sort of dona-
tion. Our other fundraising
effort that is new this year is
a taco-in-a-bag sale, which
we held on Cinco de Mayo,
and we made footprint
sugar cookies for desserts.”

Sarah Hoxeng, the co-
captain representing Lewis
and Clark Behavioral Health
Services, said that they have
done root beer floats and
bakes sales as well.

The team also does a T-
shirt design contest open to
any patient or staff member
of the three organizations.

NAMI offers support for
those suffering from mental
illness as well as support for
their family members.

“I can go online for
resources as well as go to the
local support groups,” said
Jan Lowrie, whose daughter
suffers with mental illness.
“People need to know that if
you have a mental illness, you
can still have a normal life.
Education, however, must
start with young children.”

The Yankton Bridge
Builders team is walking with
that goal in mind, to help
raise the awareness of mental
illness and the effects it can
have on families and commu-
nities because, as the group
noted, mental illness happens
in every family. The group
hopes to spread awareness
that the fear of the stigma of
mental illness can only be
removed with open discus-
sion about mental illness. 

If you would like to donate
to the Yankton Bridge
Builders team, go online to
www.nami.org/namiwalks or
contact any of the team spon-
sors.

“I just wish we could
make people understand
what an uplifting experience
this is,” Lowrie said. “We
take for granted the knowl-
edge base we have in
Yankton; it isn’t that way
everywhere. This event
helps educate everyone.”

NAMI Walks will take
place Saturday, May 15, at
Sertoma Park in Sioux Falls.
Check-in begins at 9 a.m.
with the walk starting at 10
a.m.

NAMI
From Page 1A

WASHINGTON (AP) —
Lettuce grown in Yuma,
Ariz., may be the source
of a widespread E. coli
outbreak in romaine let-
tuce that has sickened at
least 19 people and
prompted a recall in 23
states.

Federal investigators
are looking at a farm in
Yuma as a possible
source for the outbreak,
according to the distribu-
tor who sold the lettuce.

Freshway Foods of
Sidney, Ohio, said
Thursday it recalled let-
tuce sold in 23 states and
the District of Columbia
because of a possible link
to an E. coli outbreak
that has sickened at least
19 people — three with
life-threatening illness.

College students at
the University of
Michigan in Ann Arbor,
Ohio State in Columbus
and Daemen College in
Amherst, N.Y., are among
those who were affected
by the outbreak, accord-
ing to health depart-
ments in those states.
The health officials said
most of the victims were
sickened in April and
have already recovered.

Vice president Devon
Beer said Freshway
Foods worked with the
Food and Drug
Administration to trace
the contaminated lettuce
to a Yuma grower, whom
he would not identify.

The recall only applies
to romaine lettuce with
“best if used by” date
before or on May 12,
when Freshway Foods
stopped buying its
romaine from Yuma, Beer
said.

Officials in Arizona
also confirmed the inves-
tigation. Laura Oxley, a
spokeswoman for
Arizona’s agriculture and
health departments, said
federal officials contacted
them and told them they
suspected the source of
the E. coli outbreak was
lettuce grown in the
state. She said there were
no additional shipments
to stop because the win-
ter lettuce season has
mostly ended for the
year.

Freshway Foods said
Thursday it was recalling
romaine lettuce sold
under the Freshway and
Imperial Sysco brands.
No contamination was
found at the company’s
processing plant, accord-
ing to the FDA. New York
state’s Public Health
Laboratory discovered
the contamination in a
bag of Freshway Foods
shredded romaine lettuce
on Wednesday after local
authorities had been
investigating an outbreak
for several weeks.

The most common
strain of E. coli found in
U.S. patients is E. coli
O157. The CDC said the
strain linked to the let-
tuce, E. coli 0145, is more
difficult to identify and
may go unreported.

E. coli infection can
cause mild diarrhea or
more severe complica-
tions, including kidney
damage. The three
patients with life-threat-
ening symptoms were
diagnosed with hemolytic
uremic syndrome, which
can cause bleeding in the
brain or kidneys.

Outbreak
May Be

From Ariz.
Lettuce Farm


